
City of Coleman
5th Avenue Drainage Improvements Re-Bid
Bid Date: March 25, 2026 at 3:00 PM
JM Project Number: 22519
TDA CDBG No. CDV23-0082

BID TABULATION

Abilene, Texas

Item # Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 Mobilization, Bonds and Insurance 1 LS 20,000.00$        20,000.00$        37,150.00$     37,150.00$            
2 Demolition and Haul Off 1 LS 35,000.00$        35,000.00$        92,000.00$     92,000.00$            
3 Prepared Subgrade 1,710 SY 7.00$                  11,970.00$        11.25$            19,237.50$            
4 Crushed Aggregate Base Course 315 CY 75.00$                23,625.00$        98.40$            30,996.00$            
5 Asphalt Prime Coat 356 GAL 20.00$                7,120.00$          * 14.25$            5,073.00$              
6 Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement (2" Type D) 1,424 SY 20.00$                28,480.00$        55.65$            79,245.60$            
7 Curb and Gutter 78 LF 35.00$                2,730.00$          49.50$            3,861.00$              
8 Slotted Curb and Gutter 84 LF 38.00$                3,192.00$          49.50$            4,158.00$              
9 Concrete Driveway 215 SY 200.00$             43,000.00$        200.50$          43,107.50$            

10 Crushed Aggregate Base Driveway 53 SY 40.00$                2,120.00$          212.00$          11,236.00$            
11 Concrete Lined Channel 1,110 LF 200.00$             222,000.00$      305.00$          338,550.00$          
12 Metal Beam Guard Fence w/ Concrete Mow Strip 72 LF 80.00$                5,760.00$          216.50$          15,588.00$            
13 4'x3' RCB Culvert w/ Concrete Headwall, Complete in Place 87 LF 800.00$             69,600.00$        1,022.00$       88,914.00$            
14 4'x2' RCB Culvert w/ Concrete Headwall, Complete in Place 62 LF 750.00$             46,500.00$        1,020.00$       63,240.00$            
15 2-18" RCP Culverts w/ Concrete Headwall, Complete in Place 32 LF 300.00$             9,600.00$          1,300.00$       41,600.00$            
16 Concrete Transition w/ Baffles 17 SY 130.00$             2,210.00$          291.00$          4,947.00$              
17 Traffic Control 1 LS 8,000.00$          8,000.00$          3,700.00$       3,700.00$              
18 Erosion Control 1 LS 5,000.00$          5,000.00$          7,400.00$       7,400.00$              

545,907.00$      * 890,003.60$         

DEDUCTIBLE ALTERNATE BID A
Item # Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1A Prepared Subgrade 1,710 SY 7.00$                  11,970.00$        NO BID
2A Crushed Aggregate Base Course 315 CY 75.00$                23,625.00$        NO BID
3A Asphalt Prime Coat 356 GAL 7,300.00$          2,598,800.00$   * NO BID
4A Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement (2" Type D) 1,424 SY 20.00$                28,480.00$        NO BID

2,662,875.00$  * NO BID

DEDUCTIBLE ALTERNATE BID B
Item # Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1B Concrete Driveway 14 SY 200.00$             2,800.00$          NO BID
2B Crushed Aggregate Base Driveway 9 SY 40.00$                360.00$             NO BID
3B Concrete Lined Channel 128 LF 200.00$             25,600.00$        NO BID
4B Metal Beam Guard Fence w/ Concrete Mow Strip 20 LF 80.00$                1,600.00$          NO BID
5B 2-18" RCP Culverts w/ Concrete Headwall, Complete in Place 32 LF 300.00$             9,600.00$          NO BID

39,960.00$        NO BID

(*) - Extension Error

TOTAL DEDUCTIBLE ALTERNATE BID B (Items 1B - 5B)

TOTAL BASE BID (Items 1 - 18)

TOTAL DEDUCTIBLE ALTERNATE BID A (Items 1A - 4A)

For all Labor, Materials, Equipment, and Incidentals to Furnish and Install the 
Following:

 BP Surface Solutions, LLC d/b/a 
Dorado Construction Group 

 Bontke Brothers Construction 
Company 

424 S. Chadbourne Street102 College Drive
San Angelo, Texas 76903Abilene, Texas 79601

JM TBPE Firm # 2448
JM TBAE Firm # BR2261
JM TBPLS Firm # 10194493 1 of 1
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